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   6817 Amon Hill Road, Bastrop, LA 
 

Hunting land for sale in Morehouse Parish, 
LA. This +/- 43 acre tract just NE of 
Bastrop, LA is a hunter's paradise. This 
tract is majority young pine plantation with 
some mature hardwoods running through 
the middle of the property. Being less than 
10 minutes from Bastrop and less than 45 
minutes from Monroe this tract is a short 
drive away from feed stores, shopping 
stores, restaurants and many other things 
to always keep you occupied. There are 2 
food plots and box stands on the property in 
the middle of roughly 4 year old pine 
plantation, providing plenty of cover for your 
deer to bed. If you want a great 
hunting/investment tract that is very 
secluded and not far from town, this is the 
tract for you. Small tracts like this do not 
last long in this market and this one is 
priced to sell. Call us today to schedule 
your private showing of the 
hunting/investment paradise. 

32.812511, -91.8697687 

$120,400 
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